BID TABULATION

BID DATE: 7/22/2010
| U T A
OWNER: King County Fire Protection District 44
architecture » planning
PROJECT: Fire Station 96 - Sitework
BID FORM: Part A SUPPLEMENTAL Information: Part B
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Economy Fence Center No Bid No Bid $13,775.00 No $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No X X X X X
Road Construction NW Inc. $779,183.00 $200,207.00 $19,812.00 Yes $43.75 $10,531.00 $14,841.00 Yes X X X X X X
Interwest Development $499,815.00 No Bid No Bid Yes $14.02 $7,390.83 $16,274.00 Yes X X X X X X
* Westwater Construction $536,500.00 $173,677.00 $13,500.00 Yes $31.00 $13,500.00 $17,500.00 Yes X X X X X X
Stan Palmer Construction $890,000.00 $150,000.00 $14,000.00 Yes $13.00 $5,000.00 $7,000.00 Yes X X X X X X
Jennings Northwest $879,000.00 $153,000.00 $14,000.00 Yes $26.00 $18,120.00 $18,955.00 Yes X X X X X X
Titan Earthwork $740,000.00 $163,650.00 $13,000.00 Yes $27.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 Yes X X X X X X
Hoffman Construction $625,400.00 $173,075.00 $18,500.00 Yes $22.00 $8,320.00 $16,234.35 Yes X X X X X X
Johansen Excavation $675,000.00 $210,000.00 $13,435.00 Yes $40.00 $14,500.00 $22,500.00 Yes X X X X X X
Fardig Development $680,000.00 No Bid No Bid Yes $31.77 $9,739.50 No Bid Yes X X X X X X
* "Bidder has Notified District of alleged error and has requested withdrawal of bid."
Two low bidders per base bid listed below;
Interwest Development $499,815.00 $7,390.83
Hoffman Construction $625,400.00 $8,320.00
Stan Palmer Construction $150,000.00 $7,000.00
Jennings Northwest $153,000.00 $18,955.00

Titan Earthwork

$13,000.00

Johansen Excavating

$13,435.00
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